
Date:  08/09/2019 Bid Item: Dept:  Roads
Time:  10:00 a.m. Name:

BIDDER'S NAME →
Batteries Plus Bell Electrical 

Supply Co., Inc. VMP, Inc. Competitive 
Lighting, Inc.

City Electric 
Supply Voss Lighting

Bidder's Address

386 Bay Park Dr.    
Holland, MI 49424

6909 Queens Blvd.  
Woodside, NY 11377

3595 N. Dixie Hwy 
Bay7 Boca Raton, 

FL 33431

35035 Automation 
Dr. Clinton Twp., MI 

48035

51201 Celeste   
Shelby Twp.,MI 

48315

3839 E. Paris Ave 
SE Suite 307 Grand 

Rapids, MI 48512

Macomb County Vendor No No No Yes Yes No

Acknowledgement of Addenda Yes No Yes No Yes No
 

Prices Firm 90 Days Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

14.5W Mfg./Part Number Green Creative   
98246

Green Creative   
98246 no bid 9W LED Eiko 

09903
Green Creative   

98246
Green Creative   

98246

14.5W Price/Days Del 67 22.99 / 14 18.68 / 5 no bid 8.15 / 7 17.83 /15 14.44 / 7-10

11W Mfg./Part Number  Green Creative   
98250 

Green Creative   
28377 no bid

12W LED Eiko 
10171

Green Creative   
98250 Philips 476135

11W Price/Days Del 6  23.99 / 14 12.19 / 5 no bid 12.65 / 7 18.90 / 15 7.49 / 7-10

35W Mfg./Part Number  Green Creative   
58285 

Green Creative   
582856 no bid 7W LED Eiko 

09493
Green Creative   

58285 
Green Creative   

58285 

35W Price/Days Del 30 6.99 / 14 5.04 / 5 no bid 3.92 / 7 4.60 / 15 6.40 / 7-10

12W Mfg./Part Number Satco  S29936 Satco  S29936 Satco  S29936 12W LED Eiko 
09932

Satco  S29936 Satco  S29936

12W Price/Days Del ## 6.99 / 14 5.45 / 5 5.75 / 7 5.00 / 7 4.84 / 15 5.61 / 7-10

MACOMB COUNTY PURCHASING
BID TABULATIONS

19-48 
Various LED Replacement Lamps

 

   

 



Date:  08/09/2019 Bid Item: Dept:  Roads
Time:  10:00 a.m. Name:

BIDDER'S NAME →
Batteries Plus Bell Electrical 

Supply Co., Inc. VMP, Inc. Competitive 
Lighting, Inc.

City Electric 
Supply Voss Lighting

Bidder's Address

386 Bay Park Dr.    
Holland, MI 49424

6909 Queens Blvd.  
Woodside, NY 11377

3595 N. Dixie Hwy 
Bay7 Boca Raton, 

FL 33431

35035 Automation 
Dr. Clinton Twp., MI 

48035

51201 Celeste   
Shelby Twp.,MI 

48315

3839 E. Paris Ave 
SE Suite 307 Grand 

Rapids, MI 48512

Macomb County Vendor No No No Yes Yes No

Acknowledgement of Addenda Yes No Yes No Yes No

MACOMB COUNTY PURCHASING
BID TABULATIONS

19-48 
Various LED Replacement Lamps

23W Mfg./Part Number Satco S9951 Satco S9951 Satco S9951 Satco 09951 Satco S9951 Satco S9951

23W Mfg./Part Number ## 11.99 / 14 8.75 / 5 10.25 / 7 12.75 / 3 9.62 / 15 9.57 / 7-10

11.5W Mfg./Part Number Satco S9996 Satco S9996 Satco S9996 15W LED Eiko 
09790

Satco S9996 Satco S9996

11.5W Price/Days Del 20 15.99 / 14 12.05 / 5 14.64 / 7 11.53 / 7 12.85 / 15 9.41 / 7-10

19.5W Mfg./Part Number  Green Creative   
98209 

Green Creative   
98209 no bid

11W LED Eiko 
10071

Green Creative   
98209 

Green Creative   
98209 

19.5W Price/Days Del 8  29.99 / 14 29.24 / 5 no bid 4.00 / 7 22.56 / 15 26.72 / 7-10

20W Mfg./Part Number Satco S8928 Satco S8928 Satco S8928 20W LED Eiko 
09694 Satco S8928 Satco S8928

20W Price/Days Del 4 51.99 / 14 43.95 / 5 45.95 / 7 55.13 / 7 42.96 / 15 42.73 / 7-10

$4,909.15 $3,819.12 $2,364.10 $3,247.67 $3,743.33 $3,575.80

$3,359.48 Split cost
Supplemental Fees 35W -Philips
1) 4545 / -.28
2) 12W-Philips
Alternatives: LED11662 14W 53048 / -1.06

LED T-8 23W-Philips

 



Date:  08/09/2019 Bid Item: Dept:  Roads
Time:  10:00 a.m. Name:

BIDDER'S NAME →
Batteries Plus Bell Electrical 

Supply Co., Inc. VMP, Inc. Competitive 
Lighting, Inc.

City Electric 
Supply Voss Lighting

Bidder's Address

386 Bay Park Dr.    
Holland, MI 49424

6909 Queens Blvd.  
Woodside, NY 11377

3595 N. Dixie Hwy 
Bay7 Boca Raton, 

FL 33431

35035 Automation 
Dr. Clinton Twp., MI 

48035

51201 Celeste   
Shelby Twp.,MI 

48315

3839 E. Paris Ave 
SE Suite 307 Grand 

Rapids, MI 48512

Macomb County Vendor No No No Yes Yes No

Acknowledgement of Addenda Yes No Yes No Yes No

MACOMB COUNTY PURCHASING
BID TABULATIONS

19-48 
Various LED Replacement Lamps

-1.00 53291 / -0.63
11.5W-Philips

LED12758 15W 54187 / -3.37


