



MACOMB COUNTY PURCHASING

BID TABULATIONS

DATE: 06/28/2018

BID ITEM: 18-46

DEPT: Roads

TIME: 10:00 a.m.

NAME: One Year's Requirements of Gravel, Crushed Concrete & Slag

BIDDER'S NAME →	Edward C. Levy Co.		Fiore's Crushed Concrete		
Bidder's Address	9300 Dix Ave, Dearborn		33200 Mound Rd., Sterling Heights		
Macomb County Vendor	No		Yes		
<i>Acknowledgement of Addenda</i>	NA		NA		
	23A STATE SPEC. ROAD GRAVEL				
	DELIVERY LOCATIONS				
VENDOR	Washington Twp. S.C. (per ton)	New Haven S.C. (per ton)	Clinton Twp S.C. (per ton)	Shelby Twp S.C. (per ton)	
Edward C. Levy Co.	\$17.91	\$17.79	\$16.35	\$16.71	
Fiore's Crushed Concrete	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	21AA CRUSHED CONCRETE				
	DELIVERY LOCATIONS				
VENDOR	Washington Twp. S.C. (per ton)	New Haven S.C. (per ton)	Clinton Twp S.C. (per ton)	Shelby Twp S.C. (per ton)	
**Edward C. Levy Co.	\$20.51	\$19.91	\$19.19	\$19.31	
Fiore's Crushed Concrete	12.69	13.89	12.69	12.69	
** Alt. Bid: 21AA BF Slag					



MACOMB COUNTY PURCHASING

BID TABULATIONS

DATE: 06/28/2018

BID ITEM: 18-46

DEPT: Roads

TIME: 10:00 a.m.

NAME: One Year's Requirements of Gravel, Crushed Concrete & Slag

BIDDER'S NAME →	Edward C. Levy Co.	Fiore's Crushed Concrete		
Bidder's Address	9300 Dix Ave, Dearborn	33200 Mound Rd., Sterling Heights		
	321 CRUSHED CONCRETE			
	DELIVERY LOCATIONS			
VENDOR	Washington Twp. S.C. (per ton)	New Haven S.C. (per ton)	Clinton Twp S.C. (per ton)	Shelby Twp S.C. (per ton)
Edward C. Levy Co.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Fiore's Crushed Concrete	13.69	14.89	13.69	13.69
	3X1BF/ton			
	DELIVERY LOCATIONS			
VENDOR	Washington Twp. S.C. (per ton)	New Haven S.C. (per ton)	Clinton Twp S.C. (per ton)	Shelby Twp S.C. (per ton)
Edward C. Levy Co.	\$22.01	\$21.41	\$20.69	\$20.81
Fiore's Crushed Concrete	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid



MACOMB COUNTY PURCHASING

BID TABULATIONS

DATE: 06/28/2018

BID ITEM: 18-46

DEPT: Roads

TIME: 10:00 a.m.

NAME: One Year's Requirements of Gravel, Crushed Concrete & Slag

BIDDER'S NAME →	Edward C. Levy Co.	Fiore's Crushed Concrete		
Bidder's Address	9300 Dix Ave, Dearborn	33200 Mound Rd., Sterling Heights		
	STEEL SLAG FURNACE 22X/ton			
	DELIVERY LOCATIONS			
VENDOR	Washington Twp. S.C. (per ton)	New Haven S.C. (per ton)	Clinton Twp S.C. (per ton)	Shelby Twp S.C. (per ton)
Edward C. Levy Co.	\$12.26	\$11.54	\$10.39	\$11.06
Fiore's Crushed Concrete	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid