



MACOMB COUNTY PURCHASING BID TABULATIONS

Date: 06/28/2018
Time: 10:00 a.m.

Bid Item: 18-45
Name: One(1) Year's Requirements of Asphalt Materials

Dept: Roads

| | | | | | | |
|-----------------------------------|---------------------------------------|------------------------------|---|--|--|--|
| BIDDER'S NAME → | Surface Coatings | Ajax Materials | Cadillac Asphalt | | | |
| Bidder's Address | 2280 Auburn Rd. Auburn Hills 48326 | 1957 Crooks Troy MI 48084 | 12345 23 Mile Rd. Shelby Twp. MI 48315 | | | |
| Macomb County Vendor | No | Yes | Yes | | | |
| <i>Acknowledgement of Addenda</i> | NA | NA | NA | | | |
| <i>BID BOND RECEIVED</i> | NA | NA | NA | | | |

The Macomb County Department of Roads will not pay fuel surcharges.

UPM - Permanent Pavement Repair Material

| | Picked Up at | Service Center Delivery Locations in 50 Ton increments | | | | |
|--------------------------|-----------------------------------|--|-----------|--------------|-------------|--|
| VENDOR | Cost/ton | Washington Twp. | New Haven | Clinton Twp. | Shelby Twp. | |
| Surface Coatings/GemSeal | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | |
| Ajax Materials | New Haven/Roch. Hills \$110.00 | \$120.25 | \$120.25 | \$115.00 | \$115.00 | |
| Cadillac Asphalt | Mt. Clemens \$106.00 | \$109.00 | \$109.00 | \$108.00 | \$108.00 | |

CP5 Modified

| | Picked Up at | Service Center Delivery Locations in 50 Ton increments | | | | |
|--------------------------|-----------------------------|--|------------|--------------|-------------|--|
| VENDOR | Cost/ton | Washington Twp. | New Haven. | Clinton Twp. | Shelby Twp. | |
| Surface Coatings/GemSeal | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | |
| Ajax Materials | Rochester Hills \$105.00 | \$113.00 | \$115.00 | \$110.00 | \$110.00 | |
| Cadillac Asphalt | Mt. Clemens \$103.00 | \$106.00 | \$107.00 | \$106.75 | \$107.75 | |



**MACOMB COUNTY PURCHASING
BID TABULATIONS**

Date: 06/28/2018
Time: 10:00 a.m.

Bid Item: 18-45
Name: One(1) Year's Requirements of Asphalt Materials

Dept: Roads

| | | | | | | |
|-------------------------|---------------------------------------|------------------------------|---|--|--|--|
| BIDDER'S NAME → | Surface Coatings | Ajax Materials | Cadillac Asphalt | | | |
| Bidder's Address | 2280 Auburn Rd. Auburn Hills 48326 | 1957 Crooks Troy MI 48084 | 12345 23 Mile Rd. Shelby Twp. MI 48315 | | | |
| | | | | | | |

1300T Hot Asphalt - 50 Tons, APPROXIMATELY - No Quantities Guaranteed

| VENDOR | Pick Up at | Cost/ton |
|--------------------------|--------------------|----------|
| Surface Coatings/GemSeal | No Bid | No Bid |
| Ajax Materials | New Haven / Warren | \$67.00 |
| Cadillac Asphalt | Shelby Twp. | \$59.00 |
| | | |
| | | |

1100T Hot Asphalt

| VENDOR | Pick Up at | Cost/ton |
|--------------------------|--------------------|----------|
| Surface Coatings/GemSeal | No Bid | No Bid |
| Ajax Materials | New Haven / Warren | \$66.00 |
| Cadillac Asphalt | Shelby Twp. | \$59.00 |
| | | |

SS1H Asphalt Tack Coat - 5 Gallon Pail - 150 Pails, APPROXIMATELY - No Quantities Guaranteed

| VENDOR | Pick Up at | Cost/per 5 Gallon Pail |
|--------------------------|-------------------------------|------------------------|
| Surface Coatings/GemSeal | 2280 Auburn Rd., Auburn Hills | \$36.00 |
| Ajax Materials | New Haven / Warren | \$60.00 |
| Cadillac Asphalt | Mt. Clemens | \$60.00 |
| | | |